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Congratulations on your decision to make the move to Crestwood Village! As Bob Gregory 
has often said, “It’s easier and more affordable than you think!” And now, it’s even easier than 
ever before, thanks to our partners Here to There Movers.  

Your Crestwood Village Leasing Counselor will work closely with you to schedule your move 
to Crestwood Village.  He or she will set a specific moving date and time with you and will 
schedule that date with our partners Here to There Movers to pack and move you. Due to the 
tremendous popularity of this service, it is important you do your best to stay on schedule 
and keep your specific moving date, once it is set. All move-ins must take place on or before 
July 31, 2014 in order to qualify for the move in special.  Keep in mind, moving dates toward 
July 31st will book up very quickly and there is a limited number of moves available per day. 

The day of your scheduled move, Here to There Movers will provide up to 10 hours of 
moving services with a truck and a two man crew. The moving services will include a 
combination of packing, moving, and unpacking, plus the use of packing materials.  Any 
hours of moving services after the initial 10 hours,  which will be paid for by Crestwood 
Village, will be charged to you. Here to There Movers will provide an estimate for any 
additional fees at a discounted rate of $50 per hour, nearly a 50% off the regular rate charged. 
You may choose whether to extend the services at your own cost, or you may choose to end 
the services at 10 hours and complete the move on your own without Here to There Movers 
assistance. 

Here to There Movers will move you to your new home at Crestwood Village, from anywhere 
within the nine counties that make up greater Indianapolis. If you live outside of the greater 
Indianapolis area you will be charged a fee of $50 for fuel and labor expense per each county 
line the company must cross. Please understand,  the moving company will not be able to 
transport any people for you or move any of your belongings to other locations such as a 
storage facility. 

Thank you for choosing Crestwood Village, we look forward to welcoming you to your new 
home!  Please do not hesitate to contact your Leasing Counselor at the number below if you 
have any questions. 


